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VEHICLE AIR CONDITIONING APPARATUS

CROSS-REFERENCE TO RELATED
APPLICATIONS

This is a U.S. national phase application under 35 U.S.C.
)371 of International Patent Application No. PCT/JP2012/
080470, filed on Nov. 26, 2012, and claims benefit of
priority to Japanese Patent Application No. 2011-270685,
filed Dec. 9, 2011. The International Application was pub-
lished on Jun. 13, 2013, as International Publication No. WO
2013/084737 under PCT Article 21(2). The entire contents
of these applications are hereby incorporated by reference.

TECHNICAL FIELD

The present invention relates to a vehicle air conditioning
apparatus applicable to, for example, electric cars.

10

configured to allow the refrigerant discharged from the
compressor to flow into the radiator, to allow part of the
refrigerant having passed through the radiator to flow into

the heat exchanger via the expansion part, to allow the
remaining refrigerant to flow into the outdoor heat
exchanger via the expansion part, and to allow the refrig-
erant having passed through the heat exchanger and the
refrigerant having passed through the outdoor heat
exchanger to be sucked into the compressor; and a cooling
and dehumidifying refrigerant circuit configured to allow the
refrigerant discharged from the compressor to flow into the
radiator, to allow the refrigerant having passed through the
radiator to flow into the outdoor heat exchanger, to allow the
refrigerant having passed through the outdoor heat
exchanger to flow into the heat exchanger via the expansion
part, and to allow the refrigerant having passed through the
heat exchanger to be sucked into the compressor (see, for
example, Patent Literature I).

BACKGROUNDART 20 CITATION LIST

Conventionally, this sort of vehicle air conditioning appa-
ratus includes: a compressor driven by an engine as a power
source of a vehicle; a radiator provided outside the vehicle
interior; and a heat exchanger provided in the vehicle
interior. With this vehicle air conditioning apparatus, a
cooling operation is performed by: releasing the heat from
the refrigerant discharged from the compressor in the radia-
tor; absorbing the heat into the refrigerant in the heat
exchanger; and supplying the air subjected to a heat
exchange with the refrigerant in the heat exchanger to the
vehicle interior. In addition, such a conventional vehicle air
conditioning apparatus includes a heater core and perform a
heating operation by: releasing the exhaust heat from the
cooling water used to cool the engine in the heater core; and
blowing the air subjected to a heat exchange with the cooling
water in the heater core to the vehicle interior. Moreover,
such a conventional vehicle air conditioning apparatus per-
forms a heating and dehumidifying operation by: cooling the
air to be supplied to the vehicle interior to a required
absolute humidity in the heat exchanger for dehumidifica-
tion; heating the cooled and dehumidified air in the heat
exchanger to a desired temperature in the heater core; and
blowing the heated air to the vehicle interior.

The above-mentioned vehicle air conditioning apparatus
uses the exhaust heat from the engine as a heat source to heat
the air for a heating operation, or a heating and dehumidi-

fying operation. Generally, an electric car uses an electric
motor as a power source, and it is difficult to acquire the
exhaust heat that can heat the air by using the electric motor
without an engine. Therefore, the above-mentioned vehicle
air conditioning apparatus is not applicable to electric cars.

To address this issue, there has been known a vehicle air
conditioning apparatus which is applicable to electric cars.
The vehicle air conditioning apparatus includes: a compres-
sor configured to compress and discharge a refrigerant; a
radiator configured to release the heat from the refrigerant;
a heat exchanger configured to absorb the heat into the
refrigerant; an outdoor heat exchanger configured to release
the heat from or absorb the heat into the refrigerant;
a heating operation refrigerant circuit configured to allow
the refrigerant discharged from the compressor to flow into
the radiator, to allow the refrigerant having passed through
the radiator to flow into the outdoor heat exchanger via the
expansion part, and to allow the refrigerant having passed
through the outdoor heat exchanger to flow into the com-
pressor; a heating and dehumidifying refrigerant circuit
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Patent Literature

PTLI: Japanese Patent Application Laid-Open No. 2001-
324237

SUMMARY OF INVENTION

Technical Problem

It has been known that the vehicle air conditioning
apparatus may improve the efliciency of the cooling opera-
tion and the cooling and dehumidifying operation by releas-
ing the heat from the refrigerant to supercool the refrigerant
in the cooling/cooling and dehumidifying refrigerant circuit
when the refrigerant is decompressed in the outdoor heat
exchanger. In order to release the heat from the refrigerant
to supercool the refrigerant in the outdoor heat exchanger, a
supercooling part is provided to flow refrigerant into the
outdoor heat exchanger in the downstream side of the
refrigerant flow direction.

However, in a case in which the supercooling part is
provided in the outdoor heat exchanger, if a refrigerant
circuit in addition to the cooling/cooling and dehumidifying
refrigerant circuit is provided, pressure loss is increased
because the refrigerant flows through the supercooling part.
This may cause a decrease in efficiency in operations other
than the cooling operation and the cooling/cooling and
dehumidifying operation.

It is therefore an object of the present invention to provide
a vehicle air conditioning apparatus that can decrease pres-
sure loss, and therefore improve the efliciency of air con-
ditioning operation.

Solution to Problem

To achieve the object, the vehicle air conditioning appa-
ratus according to the present invention includes: a com-
pressor configured to compress and discharge a refrigerant;
a radiator configured to release heat from the refrigerant; a
heat exchanger configured to absorb the heat into the refrig-
erant; an outdoor heat exchanger configured to release the
heat from or absorb the heat into the refrigerant; an outdoor
radiator configured to further release the heat from the
refrigerant having released the heat in the outdoor heat
exchanger; a cooling/cooling and dehumidifying refrigerant
circuit configured to allow the refrigerant discharged from
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the compressor to flow into the radiator, to allow the
refrigerant having passed through the radiator to flow into
the outdoor heat exchanger, to allow the refrigerant having
passed through the outdoor heat exchanger to flow into the
outdoor radiator, to allow the refrigerant having passed
through the outdoor radiator to flow into the heat exchanger
via an expansion valve and to allow the refrigerant having
passed through the heat exchanger to be sucked into the
compressor; and a heating refrigerant circuit configured to
allow the refrigerant discharged from the compressor to flow
into the radiator, to allow the refrigerant having passed
through the radiator to flow into the outdoor heat exchanger
via an expansion part, and to allow the refrigerant having
passed through the outdoor heat exchanger to be sucked into
the compressor.

By this means, the refrigerant having passed through the
outdoor radiator flows into the radiator in the cooling/
cooling and dehumidifying refrigerant circuit, meanwhile
the refrigerant having passed through the outdoor heat
exchanger is sucked into the compressor without passing
through the outdoor radiator.

Eflect of the Invention

According to the present invention, the refrigerant having
passed through the heat exchanger is supercooled in the
outdoor radiator, and therefore it is possible to improve the
efficiency of the air conditioning operation. Moreover, the
refrigerant not having passed through the heat exchanger is
sucked into the compressor without passing through the
supercooling radiator. Therefore, it is possible to reduce
pressure loss, and consequently improve the efliciency of the
air conditioning operation.

BRIEF DESCRIPTION OF DRAWINGS

FIG. 1 is a schematic view showing a vehicle air condi-
tioning apparatus according to Embodiment I of the present
invention;

FIG. 2 shows an outdoor heat exchanger unit;
FIG. 3A is a graph showing the relationship between a

valve opening signal and an opening area of the expansion
part of the first control valve;

FIG. 3B is a graph showing the relationship between a
valve opening signal and an opening area of the condensing
pressure regulating part of the first control valve;

FIG. 3C is a graph showing the relationship between a
valve opening signal and an opening area of the combination
of the expansion part and the condensing pressure regulating
part of the first control valve;

FIG. 4 is a schematic view showing the vehicle air
conditioning apparatus performing a cooling operation and
a cooling and dehumidifying operation;

FIG. 5 is a schematic view showing the vehicle air
conditioning apparatus performing a heating operation;

FIG. 6 is a schematic view showing the vehicle air
conditioning apparatus performing a first heating and dehu-

midifyingg

operation;
FIG. 7 is a schematic view showing the vehicle air

conditioning apparatus performing a second heating and
dehumidifying operation;

FIG. S is a schematic view showing the vehicle air
conditioning apparatus performing a defrosting operation;

FIG. 9 is a table showing the states of the control valve in
each operation;

FIG. 10 is a flowchart showing a determination process
for a second heating and dehumidifying operation;
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FIG. 11 is a flowchart showing a process for switching to
a second heating and dehumidifying operation;

FIG. 12 is a flowchart showing a process for controlling
operation switching;

FIG. 13 is a schematic view showing the vehicle air
conditioning apparatus according to Embodiment 2 of the
present invention;

FIG. 14 is a table showing the states of the control valve
in each operation;

FIG. 15 is a schematic view showing the vehicle air
conditioning apparatus according to Embodiment 3 of the
present invention;

FIG. 16 is a table showing the states of the control valve
in each operation;

FIG. 17 is a schematic view showing the vehicle air
conditioning apparatus according to Embodiment 4 of the
present invention;

FIG. 1S is a table showing the states of the control valve
in each operation;

FIG. 19 is a schematic view showing the vehicle air
conditioning apparatus according to Embodiment 5 of the
present invention;

FIG. 20 shows the outdoor heat exchanger unit;
FIG. 21A is a graph showing the relationship between the

valve opening and the opening area of each of the expansion
part and the condensing pressure regulating part of the first
control valve;

FIG. 21B is a graph showing the relationship between the
valve opening and the opening area of each of the expansion
part and the condensing pressure regulating part of another
example of the first control valve;

FIG. 21C is a graph showing the relationship between the
valve opening and the opening area of each of the expansion
part and the condensing pressure regulating part of further
another example of the first control valve;

FIG. 22 shows the structure of the expansion part of the
first control valve shown in FIG. 21c and explains its
actions;

FIG. 23 shows the first control valve formed integrally
with the check valve;

FIG. 24 is a schematic view showing the vehicle air
conditioning apparatus performing a cooling operation and
a cooling and dehumidifying operation;

FIG. 25 is a schematic view showing the vehicle air
conditioning apparatus performing a heating operation;

FIG. 26 is a schematic view showing the vehicle air
conditioning apparatus performing a first heating and dehu-
midi fying operation;

FIG. 27 is a schematic view showing the vehicle air
conditioning apparatus performing a second heating and
dehumidifying operation;

FIG. 2S is a schematic view showing the vehicle air
conditioning apparatus performing a defrosting operation;

FIG. 29 is a table showing the states of the control valve
in each operation;

FIG. 30 is a schematic view showing the vehicle air
conditioning apparatus according to Embodiment 6 of the
present invention; and

FIG. 31 is a table showing the states of the control valve
in each operation.

FIG. 32 is a schematic of the first control valve unit
including a three-way valve.

DESCRIPTION OF EMBODIMENTS

FIG. 1 to FIG. 12 show Embodiment I of the present
invention.
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As shown in FIG. 1, the vehicle air conditioning apparatus
according to the present invention includes an air condition-
ing unit 10 provided in the vehicle interior, and a refrigerant
circuit 20 formed across the vehicle interior and the outdoor.

The air conditioning unit 10 includes an air flow passage
11 that allows the air to be supplied to the vehicle interior to
pass through. An outdoor air inlet 11a and an indoor air inlet
11b are provided in the first end side of the air flow passage
11. The outdoor air inlet 11a is configured to allow the
outdoor air to flow into the air flow passage 11, and the
indoor air inlet 11b is configured to allow the indoor air to
flow into the air flow passage 11.Meanwhile, a foot outlet
11c,a vent outlet 11d and a defroster outlet 11e are provided
in the second end side of the air flow passage 11.The foot
outlet 11c is configured to allow the air flowing through the
air flow passage 11 to blow to the feet of the passengers in
the vehicle. The vent outlet 11d is configured to allow the air
flowing through the air flow passage 11 to blow to the upper
bodies of the passengers in the vehicle. The defroster outlet
11e is configured to allow the air flowing through the air
flow passage 11 to blow to the interior surface of the front
window.

An indoor fan 12 such as a sirocco fan configured to allow
the air to flow through the air flow passage 11 from end to
end is provided in the first end side of the air flow passage
11.

Also, in the first end side of the air flow passage 11, an
inlet switching damper 13 configured to open one of the
outdoor air inlet 11a and the indoor air inlet 11b and to close
the other. When the inlet switching damper 13 closes the
indoor air inlet 11b and opens the outdoor air inlet 11a, the
mode is switched to an outdoor air supply mode in which the
air flows from the outdoor air inlet 11a into the air flow

passage 11.Meanwhile, when the inlet switching damper 13
closes the outdoor air inlet 11a and opens the indoor air inlet
11b, the mode is switched to an indoor air circulation mode
in which the air flows from the indoor air inlet 11b into the
air flow passage 11. Moreover, when the inlet switching
damper 13 is placed between the outdoor air inlet 11a and
the indoor air inlet 11b and the outdoor air inlet 11a and the
indoor air inlet 11b open, the mode is switched to a two-way
mode in which the air flows from both the outdoor air inlet
11a and the indoor air inlet 11b into the air flow passage 11
according to the opening ratio of the outdoor air inlet 11a
and the indoor air inlet 11b.

Outlet switching dampers 13b, 13c and 13d configured to
open and close the foot outlet 11c,the vent outlet 11d and the
defroster outlet 11e are provided in the foot outlet 11c, the
vent outlet 11d and the defroster outlet 11e, respectively, in
the second side of the air flow passage 11. These outlet
switching dampers 13b, 13c and 13d are configured to move
together by a linkage (not shown). Here, when the outlet
switching dampers 13b, 13cand 13d open the foot outlet 1c,
close the vent outlet 11d and slightly open the defroster
outlet 11e, most of the air flowing through the air flow
passage 11blows out of the foot outlet 11cand the remaining
air blows out of the defroster outlet 11e. This mode is
referred to as "foot mode. " Meanwhile, when the outlet
switching dampers 13b, 13cand 13d close the foot outlet 11c
and the defroster outlet 11e, and open the vent outlet 11d, all
the air flowing through the air flow passage 11 blows out of
the vent outlet 11d. This mode is referred to as "vent mode. "
In addition, when the outlet switching dampers 13b, 13cand
13d open the foot outlet 11c and the vent outlet 11d, and
close the defroster outlet 11e, the air flowing through the air
flow passage 11blows out of the foot outlet 11cand the vent
outlet 11d. This mode is referred to as "bi-level mode. "
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Moreover, when the outlet switching dampers 13b, 13c and
13d close the foot outlet 11c and the vent outlet 11d, and
open the defroster outlet 11e, the air flowing through the air
flow passage 11 blows out of the defroster outlet 11e. This
mode is referred to as "defroster mode. "Furthermore, when
the outlet switching dampers 13b, 13c and 13d close the vent
outlet 11d and open the foot outlet 11c and the defroster
outlet 11e, the air flowing through the air flow passage 11
blows out of the foot outlet 11c and the defroster outlet 11e.
This mode is referred to as "defroster-foot mode. "Here, in
the bi-level mode, the air flow passage 11, the foot outlet
11c, the vent outlet 11d, and a heat exchanger and a radiator
which will be described later, are arranged and configured
such that the temperature of the air blowing out of the foot
outlet 11c is higher than the temperature of the air blowing
out of the vent outlet 11d.

A heat exchanger 14 is provided in the air flow passage 11
in the downstream of the air flow from the indoor fan 12.
The heat exchanger 14 is configured to cool and dehumidify
the air flowing through the air flow passage 11.In addition,
a radiator 15 is provided in the air flow passage 11 in the
downstream of the air flow from the heat exchanger 14. The
radiator 15 is configured to heat the air flowing through the
air flow passage 11.The heat exchanger 14 and the radiator
15 are heat exchangers, each of which is constituted by fins
and tubes and which is configured to perform a heat
exchange between the refrigerant flowing therethrough and
the air flowing through the air flow passage 11.

An air mix damper 16 is provided between the heat
exchanger 14 and the radiator 15 in the air flow passage 11
and is configured to control the percentage of the air to be
heated, which is flowing through the air flow passage 11.
When the air mix damper 16 is disposed in the air flow

passage 11 in the k of the radiator 15, the percentage of the
air subjected to a heat exchange in the radiator 15 is reduced.
Meanwhile, when the air mix damper 16 is moved to a
position other than the radiator 15 in the air flow passage 11,
the percentage of the air subjected to a heat exchange is
increased. In the air flow passage 11, when the air mix
damper 16 closes the upstream side of the radiator 15 and
opens the portion other than the radiator 15, the opening is
0%, and, on the other hand, when the air mix damper 16
opens the upstream side of the radiator 15 and closes the
portion other than the radiator 15, the opening is 100%.

The refrigerant circuit 20 includes: the heat exchanger 14;
the radiator 15; a compressor 21 configured to compress a
refrigerant; an outdoor heat exchanger 22 configured to
perform a heat exchange between the refrigerant and the
outdoor air; a receiver tank 23 configured to accumulate
liquid refrigerant discharged from the outdoor heat
exchanger; a supercooling radiator 24 as an outdoor radiator
configured to supercool the liquid refrigerant discharged
from the receiver tank 23; an internal heat exchanger 25
configured to perform a heat exchange between the refrig-
erant discharged from the supercooling radiator 24 and the
refrigerant discharged from the heat exchanger 14; a first
control valve 26 including an expansion part configured to
decompress the refrigerant flowing into the outdoor heat
exchanger 22 during the heating operation and the first
heating and dehumidifying operation, and a condensing
pressure regulating part configured to regulate the condens-
ing pressure of the refrigerant in the radiator 15 during the
cooling and dehumidifying operation; a second control valve
27 configured to regulate the evaporating pressure of the
refrigerant in the heat exchanger 14; first to fourth solenoid
valves 2Sa, 2Sb, 2Sc and 2Sd; first to fourth check valves
29a, 29b, 29c and 29d; an expansion valve 30; and an
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accumulator 31 configured to separate liquid refrigerant
from refrigerant vapor to prevent the liquid refrigerant from
being sucked into the compressor 21. These components are
connected to each other by a copper pipe or an aluminum

pipe.
To be more specific, input side of the radiator 15 into

which the refrigerant flows is connected to the delivery side
of the compressor 21 from which the refrigerant is dis-

charged to form the refrigerant flow passage 20a. In addi-

tion, the input side of the first control valve 26 into which the
refrigerant flows is connected to the output side of the
radiator 15 from which the refrigerant is discharged, thereby
to form the refrigerant flow passage 20b. A first connection
port of the outdoor heat exchanger 22 is connected to the
output side of the expansion part and the condensing pres-
sure regulating part of the first control valve 26 from which
the refrigerant is discharged, thereby to form the refrigerant
flow passage 20c. The input side of the receiver tank 23 into
which the refrigerant flows is connected to a second con-
nection port of the outdoor heat exchanger 22, thereby to
form the refrigerant flow passage 20d. In the refrigerant flow
passage 20d, the first solenoid valve 2Sa and the first check
valve 29a in the order from the outdoor heat exchanger 22
side. The input side of the supercooling radiator 24 into
which the refrigerant flows is connected to the output side of
the receiver tank 23 from which the refrigerant is dis-
charged, thereby to form the refrigerant flow passage 20e.
The input side of the internal heat exchanger 25 into which
a high-pressure refrigerant flows is connected to the output
side of the supercooling radiator 24 from which the refrig-
erant is discharged, thereby to form the refrigerant flow
passage 20f. The input side of the heat exchanger 14 into
which the refrigerant flows is connected to the output side of
the internal heat exchanger 25 from which the high-pressure
refrigerant is discharged, thereby to from the refrigerant flow

passage 20g. The expansion valve 30 is provided in the
refrigerant flow passage 20g. The input side of the internal
heat exchanger 25 into which a low-pressure refrigerant
flows is connected to the output side of the heat exchanger
14 from which the refrigerant is discharged, thereby to form
the refrigerant flow passage 20h. The second control valve
27 is provided in the refrigerant flow passage 20h. The
suction side of the compressor 21 into which the refrigerant
is sucked is connected to the output side of the internal heat
exchanger 25 from which the refrigerant is discharged,
thereby to form the refrigerant flow passage 20i. The third
check valve 29c and the accumulator 31 are provided in the
refrigerant flow passage 20i in the order from the internal
heat exchanger 25 side. The part of the refrigerant flow

passage 20d between the first check valve 29a and the
receiver tank 23 is connected to the refrigerant flow passage
20b, thereby to form the refrigerant flow passage 20j. The
second solenoid valve 2Sb and the second check valve 29b
are provided in the refrigerant flow passage 20j in the order
from the refrigerant flow passage 20b side. The part of the
refrigerant flow passage 20i between the third check valve
29c and the accumulator 31 is connected to a third connec-
tion port of the outdoor heat exchanger 22, thereby to form
the refrigerant flow passage 201'. The third solenoid valve
2Sc is provided in the refrigerant flow passage 201'. The
refrigerant flow passage 20c is connected to the refrigerant
flow passage 20a, thereby to form the refrigerant flow

passage 201 as a defrosting circuit. The fourth solenoid
valve 2Sd and the fourth check valve 29d are provided in the
refrigerant flow passage 201 in the order from the refrigerant
flow passage 20a.
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The compressor 21, the outdoor heat exchanger 22, the
receiver tank 23 and the supercooling radiator 24 are dis-
posed outside the vehicle interior. The outdoor heat
exchanger 22 includes an outdoor fan 32 configured to
perform a heat exchange between the outdoor air and the
refrigerant while the vehicle stops.

As shown in FIG. 2, the outdoor heat exchanger 22 is
formed integrally with the receiver tank 23, the supercooling
radiator 24, the first control valve 26, the first solenoid valve
2Sa, the second solenoid valve 2Sb, the third solenoid valve
2Sc, the first check valve 29a and the second check valve
29b to realize an outdoor heat exchanger unit U.

The outdoor heat exchanger 22 and the supercooling
radiator 24 include: a pair of upper and lower headers 22a
extending in the width direction; a plurality of flat tubes 22b
provided apart from each other and connecting between the
headers 22a; and wavy fins 22c provided between each of
the flat tubes 22b. The outdoor heat exchanger 22 is provided
in one side of the width direction of the pair of headers 22a
meanwhile the supercooling radiator 24 is provided in the
other side of the width direction of the pair of headers 22a.

Each of the header 22a is made of a cylindrical member
having closed both ends. The inside of each of the headers
22a is partitioned in the width direction by a plurality of
partition members 22d. By this means, a refrigerant flow
path that extends in the width direction, zigzagging up and
down, is formed in the outdoor heat exchanger 22. The
refrigerant flow passage 20c is connected to the lower
header 22a at a position in one space of the lower header 22a
for the outdoor heat exchanger 22. The refrigerant flow

passage 20d and the refrigerant flow passage 201' are con-
nected to the lower header 22a at respective positions in
another space for the outdoor heat exchanger 22. Moreover,
the refrigerant flow passage 20e is connected to the lower
header 22a at a position in the space for the supercooling
radiator 24. Meanwhile, the refrigerant flow passage 20f is
connected to the upper header 22a at a position in the space
for the supercooling radiator 24.

The receiver tank 23 is made of a cylindrical member
extending in the vertical direction and having closed both
ends. The refrigerant flow passages 20d and 20e are con-
nected to the lower end of the receiver tank 23. Surplus
refrigerant in the refrigerant circuit 20 is accumulated in the
receiver tank 23.

The internal heat exchanger 25 is, for example, a double-

pipe heat exchanger, and is configured to allow the refrig-
erant flowing through the refrigerant flow passage 20f to
flow into the inner pipe and to allow the refrigerant flowing
through the refrigerant flow passage 20h to flow into the
outer pipe, and therefore to perform a heat exchange
between these refrigerants.

In the first control valve 26, the refrigerant flow channel
to the expansion part and the refrigerant flow channel to the
condensing pressure regulating part are provided for one
refrigerant inlet. In addition, in the control valve 26, one
refrigerant outlet is provided for both the refrigerant flow
channel to the expansion part and the refrigerant flow
channel to the condensing pressure regulating part. A valve
element for regulating a valve opening is provided in each
of the refrigerant flow channel to the expansion part and the
refrigerant flow channel to the condensing pressure regulat-
ing part. The expansion part of the first control valve 26 has
a function as an electronic expansion valve, and the con-
densing pressure regulating part has a function as a solenoid
valve. The first control valve 26 can regulate the valve
opening between when the valve opening of each of the
expansion part and the condensing pressure regulating part
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is zero and when it is full. Also, as shown in FIG. 3, the first
control valve 26 can regulate the opening area of the
refrigerant flow channel between when the expansion part
and the condensing pressure regulating part are completely
closed and when they are fully open. FIG. 3 shows the
relationship between a valve opening signal and an opening
area, with the horizontal axis for the valve opening signal
and the vertical axis for the opening size equivalent to the
opening area of the refrigerant flow channel. FIG. 3A shows
the relationship between the valve opening signal and the
opening size equivalent to the opening area of the refrigerant
flow channel in the expansion part side. FIG. 3B shows the
relationship between the valve opening signal and the open-
ing size equivalent to the opening area of the refrigerant flow
channel in the condensing pressure regulating part side. FIG.
3C shows the relationship between the valve opening signal
and the opening size equivalent to the opening area of the
refrigerant flow channel in the combination of the expansion
part side and the condensing pressure regulating part side.

The second control valve 27 is configured to allow its
opening to be regulated step by step or optionally. The
second control valve 27 is configured to regulate an amount
of the refrigerant flowing through the refrigerant flow pas-
sage 20h by regulating the valve opening, and consequently
to regulate the evaporating pressure of the refrigerant in the
heat exchanger 14.

The expansion valve 30 is a temperature expansion valve
having the adjustable opening according to the temperature
of the refrigerant discharged from the heat exchanger 14.As
a temperature expansion valve, for example, a box type
temperature valve including a refrigerant outlet channel that
allows the refrigerant flowing out of the heat exchanger to
flow through, a temperature-sensitive rod that detects the
temperature of the refrigerant flowing out of the refrigerant
outlet channel, and a diaphragm to move the valve element,
which are integrally formed.

As shown in FIG. 1, the vehicle air conditioning apparatus
further includes a controller 40 configured to control the
number of rotations of the compressor 21, the valve opening
of the first control valve 26, the valve opening of the second
control valve 27, and the opening and closing of each of the
first to fourth solenoid valves 2Sa, 2Sb, 2Sc and 2Sd.

The compressor 21, the first control valve 26, the second
control valve 27, and the first to fourth solenoid valves 2Sa,
2Sb, 2Sc and 2Sd are connected to the output side of the
controller 40. Meanwhile, a high-pressure refrigerant tem-
perature sensor 41 configured to detect temperature Thp1 of
a high-pressure refrigerant flowing through the refrigerant
flow passage 20b; a high-pressure refrigerant pressure sen-
sor 42 configured to detect pressure Phpl of the high-
pressure refrigerant flowing through the refrigerant flow
passage 20b; a low-pressure refrigerant temperature sensor
43 configured to detect temperature Thp2 of a low-pressure
refrigerant flowing through the refrigerant flow passage 201';
a low-pressure refrigerant pressure sensor 44 configured to
detect pressure Php2 of the low-pressure refrigerant flowing
through the refrigerant flow passage 201'; an intake air
temperature sensor 45 configured to detect temperature T of
air flowing through the air flow passage 11 upstream from
the heat exchanger 14; a cooled air temperature sensor 46
configured to detect temperature Tc flowing downstream
from the heat exchanger 14; a sucked refrigerant tempera-
ture sensor 47 configured to detect the temperature of the
refrigerant flowing through the refrigerant flow passage 20i
that is sucked into the compressor 21; a sucked refrigerant
pressure sensor 4S configured to detect the pressure of the
refrigerant flowing through the refrigerant flow passage 20i
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that is sucked into the compressor 21; a discharged refrig-
erant pressure sensor 49 configured to detect the pressure of
the refrigerant flowing through the refrigerant flow passage
20a that is discharged from the compressor 21; an input
refrigerant temperature sensor 50 configured to detect the
temperature of the refrigerant flowing through the refriger-
ant flow passage 20a that flows into the radiator 15; and an
input refrigerant pressure sensor 51 configured to detect the
pressure of the refrigerant flowing through the refrigerant
flow passage 20a that flows into the radiator 15; and a
pressure sensor 52 configured to detect the pressure of the
refrigerant flowing through the refrigerant flow passage 20f,
are connected to the input side of the controller 40. Here, the
high-pressure refrigerant temperature sensor 41 and the
high-pressure refrigerant pressure sensor 42 do not neces-
sarily need to be separated, but may be integrally formed.
Also, the sucked refrigerant temperature sensor 47 and the
sucked refrigerant pressure sensor 4S do not necessarily
need to be separated, but may be integrally formed. More-
over, the input refrigerant temperature sensor 50 and the
input refrigerant pressure sensor 51 do not necessarily need
to be separated, but may be integrally formed.

The vehicle air conditioning apparatus having the above-
described configuration performs cooling operation, cooling
and dehumidifying operation, heating operation, first heat-
ing and dehumidifying operation as heating and dehumidi-

fying operation, second heating and dehumidifying opera-
tion as internal heating and dehumidifying operation, and
first defrosting operation. Now, each operation will be
explained.

During the cooling operation and the cooling and dehu-

midifying operation, in the refrigerant circuit 20, the refrig-
erant flow channel to the expansion part is closed while the
refrigerant flow channel to the condensing pressure regulat-
ing part is opened in the first control valve 26; the first
solenoid valve 2Sa is opened; the second, third and fourth
solenoid valves 2Sb, 2Sc and 2Sd are closed; and compressor
21 is operated. By this means, as shown in FIG. 4, the
refrigerant discharged from the compressor 21 flows through
in this order: the refrigerant flow passage 20a; the radiator
15; the refrigerant flow passage 20b; the condensing pres-
sure regulating part of the first control valve 26; the refrig-
erant flow passage 20c; the outdoor heat exchanger 22;
refrigerant flow passage 20d; the receiver tank 23; the
refrigerant flow passage 20e; the supercooling radiator 24;
the refrigerant flow passage 20f; the high-pressure side of
the internal heat exchanger 25; the refrigerant flow passage
20g; the heat exchanger 14; the refrigerant flow passage 20h;
the low-pressure side of the internal heat exchanger 25; and
the refrigerant flow passage 20i, and is sucked into the
compressor 21. During the cooling operation, the refrigerant
flowing through the refrigerant circuit 20 releases the heat in
the outdoor heat exchanger 22 and absorbs the heat in the
heat exchanger 14. During the cooling and dehumidifying
operation, when the air mix damper 16 is opened as shown

by the dashed-dotted line of FIG. 4, the refrigerant flowing
through the refrigerant circuit 20 releases the heat also in the
radiator 15.

In this case, in the air conditioning unit 10 during the
cooling operation, the indoor fan 12 is operated to flow the
air through the air flow passage 11, and the air is subjected
to a heat exchange with the refrigerant in the heat exchanger
14 and cooled. The temperature of the cooling air becomes
target air-blowing temperature TAO of the air to blow out of
the outlets 11c, 11d and 11e to the vehicle interior in order
to set the temperature of the vehicle interior to the target
preset temperature Tset.
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The target air-blowing temperature TAO is calculated
based on the preset temperature Tset, and environmental
conditions including the outdoor air temperature Tam, the
indoor air temperature Tr, and an amount of insolation Ts.

Meanwhile, in the air conditioning unit 10 during the
cooling and dehumidifying operation, the indoor fan 12 is
operated to flow the air through the air flow passage 11, and
the air is subjected to a heat exchange with the refrigerant
which absorbs the heat in the heat exchanger 14, and
therefore is cooled and dehumidified. The air having been
dehumidified in the heat exchanger 14 is subjected to a heat
exchange with the refrigerant which releases the heat in the
radiator 15, and therefore heated. As a result, the air at the
target air-blowing temperature TAO blows to the vehicle
interior.

During the cooling and dehumidifying operation, the
opening of the condensing pressure regulating part of the
first control valve 26 is adjusted to regulate the condensing
pressure of the refrigerant in the radiator 15. That is, it is
possible to control the quantity of heat release in the radiator
15 by regulating the condensing pressure of the refrigerant
in the radiator 15. To be more specific, the condensing
pressure of the refrigerant in the radiator 15 is decreased by
increasing the opening of the condensing pressure regulating
part of the first control valve 26, and, on the other hand, is
increased by decreasing the opening. By this means, the
quantity of heat release in the radiator 15 is decreased by
decreasing the condensing pressure but is increased by
increasing the condensing pressure.

During the cooling operation and the cooling and dehu-

midifying operation, the refrigerant having passed through
the outdoor heat exchanger 22 flows into the supercooling
radiator 24 via the receiver tank 23. Therefore, the liquid
refrigerant flowing into the supercooling radiator 24 is
subjected to a heat exchange with the outdoor air and
becomes in a supercooling state.

During the heating operation, in the refrigerant circuit 20,
the refrigerant flow channel to the expansion part is opened
while the refrigerant flow channel to the condensing pres-
sure regulating part is closed in the first control valve 26; the
third solenoid valve 2Sc is opened; the first, second, and
fourth solenoid valves 2Sa, 2Sb and 2Sd are closed; and the
compressor 21 is operated. By this means, as shown in FIG.
5, the refrigerant discharged from the compressor 21 flows
through in this order: the refrigerant flow passage 20a; the
radiator 15; the refrigerant flow passages 20b; the expansion
part of the first control valve 26; the refrigerant flow

passages 20c; the outdoor heat exchanger 22; and the
refrigerant flow passages 22k. and 20i, and is sucked into the
compressor 21. The refrigerant flowing through the refrig-
erant circuit 20 releases the heat in the radiator 15 and
absorbs the heat in the outdoor heat exchanger 22.

In this case, in the air conditioning unit 10, the indoor fan
12 is operated to flow the air through the air flow passage 11,
and the flowing air is not subjected to a heat exchange with
the refrigerant in the heat exchanger 14, but is subjected to
a heat exchange with the refrigerant in the radiator 15 and
therefore is heated. As a result, the air at the target air-
blowing temperature TAO blows to the vehicle interior.

During the first heating and dehumidifying operation, in
the refrigerant circuit 20, the refrigerant flow channel to the
expansion part is opened while the refrigerant flow channel
to the condensing pressure regulating part is closed in the
first control valve 26; the second and third solenoid valves
2Sb and 2Sc are opened; the first and fourth solenoid valves
2Sa and 2Sd are closed; and the compressor 21 is operated.
By this means, as shown in FIG. 6, the refrigerant discharged
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from the compressor 21 flows through in this order: the
refrigerant flow passage 20a; the radiator 15; and the refrig-
erant flow passage 20b. Part of the refrigerant flowing
through the refrigerant flow passage 20b flows through in
this order: the expansion part of the first control valve 26; the
refrigerant flow passage 20c; the outdoor heat exchanger 22;
and the refrigerant flow passages 20k. and 20i, and is sucked
into the compressor 21. Meanwhile, the remaining refriger-
ant flowing through the refrigerant flow passage 20b flows

through in this order: the refrigerant flow passages 20j and
20d; the receiver tank 23; the refrigerant flow passage 20e;
the supercooling radiator 24, the refrigerant flow passage
20f; the high-pressure side of the internal heat exchanger 25;
the refrigerant flow passage 20g; the heat exchanger 14; the
refrigerant flow passage 20h; the low-pressure side of the
internal heat exchanger 25; and the refrigerant flow passage
20i, and is sucked into the compressor 21. The refrigerant
flowing through the refrigerant circuit 20 releases the heat in
the radiator 15 and absorbs the heat in the heat exchanger 14
and the outdoor heat exchanger 22.

In this case, in the air conditioning unit 10, the indoor fan
12 is operated to flow the air through the air flow passage 11,
and the flowing air is subjected to a heat exchange with the
refrigerant in the heat exchanger 14, and therefore is cooled
and dehumidified. Part of the air having been dehumidified
in the heat exchanger 14 is subjected to a heat exchange with
the refrigerant in the radiator 15 and heated. As a result, the
air at the target air-blowing temperature TAO blows into the
vehicle interior.

In addition, the evaporating temperature of the refrigerant
in the heat exchanger 14 is controlled by regulating the
opening of the second control valve 27. That is, when the
opening of the second control valve 27 is decreased, the
evaporating temperature of the refrigerant in the heat
exchanger 14 increases. On the other hand, when the open-
ing of the second control valve 27 is increased, the evapo-
rating temperature decreases.

During the second heating and dehumidifying operation,
in the refrigerant circuit 20, both the refrigerant flow channel
to the expansion part and the refrigerant flow channel to the
condensing pressure regulating part are closed in the first
control valve 26; the second solenoid valve 2Sb is opened;
the first, third and fourth solenoid valves 2Sa, 2Sc and 2Sd
are closed; and the compressor 21 is operated. By this
means, as shown in FIG. 7, the refrigerant discharged from
the compressor 21 flows through in this order: the refrigerant
flow passage 20a; the radiator 15; the refrigerant flow
passages 20b, 20j and 20d; the receiver tank 23; the refrig-
erant flow passages 20e; the supercooling radiator 24; the
refrigerant flow passages 20f; the high-pressure side of the
internal heat exchanger 25; the refrigerant flow passages
20g; the heat exchanger 14; the refrigerant flow passages
20h; the low-pressure side of the internal heat exchanger 25;
and the refrigerant flow passages 20i, and is sucked into the
compressor 21. The refrigerant flowing through the refrig-
erant circuit 20 releases the heat in the radiator 15 and
absorbs the heat in the heat exchanger 14.

In this case, in the air conditioning unit 10, the indoor fan
12 is operated to flow the air through the air flow passage 11,
and the flowing air is subjected to a heat exchange with the
refrigerant in the heat exchanger 14, and therefore is cooled
and dehumidified in the same way as in the first heating and
dehumidifying operation. Part of the air dehumidified in the
heat exchanger 14 is subjected to a heat exchange with the
refrigerant in the radiator 15, and therefore heated. As a
result, the air at the target air-blowing temperature TAO
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blows to the vehicle interior. Here, the air flowing into the
air flow passage 11 may be the outdoor air or the indoor air.

During the defrosting operation, in the refrigerant circuit
20, the refrigerant flow channel to the expansion part is
opened while the refrigerant flow channel to the condensing
pressure regulating part is closed in the first control valve 26;
the third and fourth solenoid valves 2Sc and 2Sd are opened
while the first and second solenoid valves 2Sa and 2Sb are
closed; and the compressor 21 is operated. By this means, as
shown in FIG. S, part of the refrigerant discharged from the
compressor 21 flows through in this order: the refrigerant
flow passage 20a; the radiator 15; the refrigerant flow

passage 20b; the expansion part of the first control valve 26;
and the refrigerant flow passage 20c, and is sucked into the
compressor 21. Meanwhile, the remaining refrigerant dis-
charged from the compressor 21 flows through the refrig-
erant flow passages 201 and 20c, and flows into the outdoor
heat exchanger 22. The refrigerant discharged from the
outdoor heat exchanger 22 flows through the refrigerant flow

passages 20k. and 20i, and is sucked into the compressor 21.
The refrigerant flowing through the refrigerant circuit 20
releases the heat in the radiator 15, and at this time, absorbs
the heat in the outdoor heat exchanger 22.

In this case, in the air conditioning unit 10, the indoor fan
12 is operated to flow the air through the air flow passage 11.
The flowing air is not subjected to a heat exchange with the
refrigerant in the heat exchanger 14, but is subjected to a
heat exchange with the refrigerant which releases the heat in
the radiator 15, and therefore is heated and then blows to the
vehicle interior.

In the above-described air conditioning operations, the
opening and closing of each of the first control valve 26, the
second control valve 27, and the first to fourth solenoid
valves is switched as shown in the table of FIG. 9.

While an automatic switch is turned on, the operation is
switched among the cooling operation, the cooling and
dehumidifying operation, the heating operation, the first
heating and dehumidifying operation, the second heating
and dehumidifying operation and the defrosting operation,
based on environmental conditions including the outdoor air
temperature Tam, the indoor air temperature Tr, the outdoor
air humidity, the indoor air humidity Th, the amount of
insolation Ts and so forth.

In addition, the mode of the outlets 11c, 11d and 11e are
switched by the outlet switching dampers 13b, 13c and 13d.
The opening of the air mix damper 16 is controlled such that
the temperature of the air blowing out of the outlets 11c, 11d
and 11e is the target air-blowing temperature TAO.

In each operation, switching the operation among the foot
mode, the vent mode and the bi-level mode of each of the
outlets 11c, 11d and 11e is performed according to the target
air-blowing temperature TAO. To be more specific, when the
target air-blowing temperature TAO is high, for example, 40
degrees Celsius, the mode is set to the foot mode. Mean-
while, when the target air-blowing temperature TAO is low,
for example, lower than 25 degrees Celsius, the mode is set
to the vent mode. Moreover, when the target air-blowing
temperature TAO is the temperature between the tempera-
ture for the foot mode and the temperature for the vent mode,
the mode is set to the bi-level mode.

When each of the outlets 11c, 11d and 11e is set to the
bi-level mode, the controller performs a determination pro-
cess for second heating and dehumidifying operation to
determine whether or not to perform the second heating and
dehumidifying operation. Now, the operation of the control-
ler 40 in this process will be explained with reference to the
flowchart of FIG. 10.
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(Step 1)
In step 1, the CPU determines whether or not each of the

outlets 11c, 11d and 11e is set to the bi-level mode. When
determining that the outlets are set to the bi-level mode, the
CPU moves the step to step S2. On the other hand, when
determining that the outlets are not set to the bi-level mode,
the CPU ends the determination process for second heating
and dehumidifying operation.

(Step S2)
In the case of determining that the bi-level mode is set in

the step S1, the CPU determines whether or not temperature
T detected by the intake air temperature sensor 45 is first
predetermined temperature Tl (e.g. 10 to 15 degrees Cel-
sius) or higher in the step S2. When determining that the
temperature T detected by the intake air temperature sensor
45 is the first predetermined temperature Tl or higher, the
CPU moves the step to step S3. On the other hand, when
determining that the temperature T detected by the intake air
temperature 45 is lower than the first predetermined tem-
perature Tl, the CPU moves the step to step S5.

(Step S3)
In the case of determining that the temperature T detected

by the intake air temperature sensor 45 is the first predeter-
mined temperature Tl or higher in the step 2, the CPU
determines whether or not the temperature T detected by the
intake air temperature sensor 45 is second predetermined
temperature T2 (e.g. 20 to 25 degrees Celsius) or higher in
the step S3.When determining that the temperature detected
by the intake air temperature sensor 45 is the second
predetermined temperature T2 or higher, the CPU moves the
step to the step S5. On the other hand, when determining that
the temperature T detected by the intake air temperature
sensor 45 is lower than the second predetermined tempera-
ture (Tl&T&T2), the CPU moves the step to step S4.

(Step S4)
In the case of determining that the temperature detected

by the intake air temperature sensor 45 is lower than the
second predetermined temperature T2 in the step S3, the
CPU starts the second heating and dehumidifying operation
and ends the determination process for second heating and
dehumidifying operation in the step S4.

(Step S5)
In the case of determining that the temperature T detected

by the intake air temperature sensor 45 is lower than the first
predetermined temperature in the step S2, or in the case of
determining that the temperature T is the second predeter-
mined temperature T2 or higher in the step S3, the CPU ends
the second heating and dehumidifying operation in the step
5, and ends the determination process for second heating and
dehumidifying operation.

whether or not to perform the second heating and dehu-
midifying operation may be determined not only based on
the temperature T of the air flowing upstream the heat
exchanger 14, but also the temperature of the outdoor air.

In addition, during the cooling and dehumidifying opera-
tion, or the first heating and dehumidifying operation, when
each of the outlets 11c, 11d and 11e is set to the bi-level
mode, a process for switching to second heating and dehu-
midifying operation is performed to switch the operation to
the second heating and dehumidifying operation, based on
the temperature of the air after a heat exchange with the
refrigerant in the heat exchanger 14. Now, the operation of
the controller 40 in this process will be explained with
reference to the flowchart of FIG. 11.

(Step S11)
In step S11, the CPU determines whether or not the

cooling and dehumidifying operation is being performed.
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When determining that the cooling and dehumidifying
operation is being performed, the CPU moves the step to
step 12. On the other hand, when determining that the
heating and dehumidifying operation is not being per-
formed, the CPU moves the step to step S13.

(Step S12)
In the case of determining that the cooling and dehumidi-

fying operation is being performed in the step S11,the CPU
determines whether or not temperature Tc detected by the
cooled air temperature sensor 46 is a third predetermined
temperature Tc I or lower in the step 12. When determining
that the temperature Tc detected by the cooled air tempera-
ture sensor 46 is the third predetermined temperature Tc1 or
lower, the CPU moves the step to step 15.On the other hand,
determining that the temperature Tc is higher than the third
predetermined temperature Tc1, the CPU ends the process
for switching to second heating and dehumidifying opera-
tion.

(Step 13)
In the case of determining that the cooling and dehumidi-

fying operation is not being performed in the step S11, the
CPU determines whether or not the first heating and dehu-
midifying operation is being performed. When determining
that the first heating and dehumidifying operation is being
performed, the CPU moves the step to step S14.On the other
hand, when determining that the first heating and dehumidi-

fying operation is not being performed, the CPU ends the
process for switching to second heating and dehumidifying
operation.

(Step 14)
In the case of determining that the first heating and

dehumidifying operation is being performed in the step S13,
the CPU determines whether or not the temperature Tc
detected by the cooled air temperature sensor 46 is a fourth
predetermined temperature Tc2 or higher. When determining
that the temperature Tc detected by the cooled air tempera-
ture sensor 36 is the fourth predetermined temperature Tc2
or higher, the CPU moves the step to step S15. On the other
hand, when determining that the temperature is lower than
the fourth predetermined temperature Tc2, the CPU ends the
process for switching to second heating and dehumidifying
operation.

(Step S15)
In the case of determining that the temperature Tc

detected by the cooled air temperature sensor 46 is the third
predetermined temperature Tcl or lower in the step S12, or
in the case of determining that the temperature Tc detected
by the cooled air temperature sensor 46 is the fourth pre-
determined temperature Tc2 or higher in the step S14, the
CPU switches the operation to the second heating and
dehumidifying operation in the step S15, and ends the
process for switching to second heating and dehumidifying
operation.

The operation may be switched to the second heating and
dehumidifying operation not only based on the temperature
Tc of the air flowing downstream from the heat exchanger
14, but also based on a predicted value of the air flowing
downstream from the radiator 15.

In addition, during the second heating and dehumidifying
operation, the temperature of the air flowing downstream
from the radiator 15 is regulated by controlling the number
of rotations of the compressor 21. Moreover, during the
second heating and dehumidifying operation, since the out-
lets 11c, 11c and 11e are set to the bi-level mode, the
temperature of the air supplied to the vehicle interior is
controlled to be the target air-blowing temperature TAO, by
adjusting the opening of the air mix damper 16 within a
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predetermined range. In this case, the number of rotations of
the compressor 21 is controlled, based on any of, or a
combination of any of: the pressure of the high-pressure side
of the refrigerant circuit 20; the temperature of the high-
pressure side of the refrigerant circuit 20; the temperature of
the air flowing through the air flow passage 11; and the
temperature of the air flowing downstream from the heat
exchanger 14.

In addition, regardless of whether or not the outlets 11c,
11d and 11e are set to the bi-level mode, the controller 40
performs an process for controlling operation switching to
switch the operation among the first heating and dehumidi-

fying operation, the second heating and dehumidifying
operation and the cooling operation or the cooling and
dehumidifying operation. Now, the operation of the control-
ler 40 in this process will be explained with reference to the
flowchart of FIG. 12.

(Step S21)
In step S21, the CPU determines whether or not the first

heating and dehumidifying operation is being performed.
When determining that the first heating and dehumidifying
operation is being performed, the CPU moves the step to
step S22. On the other hand, when determining that the first
heating and dehumidifying operation is not being per-
formed, the CPU moves the step to step S24.

(Step S22)
In the case of determining that the first heating and

dehumidifying operation is being performed in the step S21,
the CPU determines whether or not the diflerence (Tc—TEO)
between the temperature Tc detected by the cooled air
temperature sensor 46 and the target temperature TEO of the
air flowing downstream from the heat exchanger 14 is
greater than a predetermined value. When determining that
the difl'erence (Tc—TEO) is greater than the predetermined
value, the CPU moves the step to step S27. On the other
hand, when determining that the difl'erence is the predeter-
mined value or smaller, the CPU moves the step to step S23.

(Step S23)
In the case of determining that the difl'erence (Tc—TEO)

between the detected temperature Tc and the target tempera-
ture TEO is the predetermined value or smaller in the step
S22; or, in step 26 described later, when determining that the
difl'erence (TCO —TH) between target temperature TCO of
the air flowing downstream from the radiator 15 and esti-
mated temperature TH of the air flowing downstream from
the radiator 15 is greater than a predetermined value, or
determining that the diflerence (TEO—Tc) between the target
temperature TEO of the air flowing downstream from the
heat exchanger 14 and the temperature Tc detected by the
cooled air temperature sensor 46 is greater than the prede-
termined value, the CPU performs the first heating and
dehumidifying operation in the step S23, and ends the
process for controlling operation switching.

(Step S24)
In the case of determining that the first heating and

dehumidifying operation is not being performed in the step
S21, the CPU determines whether or not the second heating
and dehumidifying operation is being performed in step S24.
When determining that the second heating and dehumidify-
ing operation is being performed, the CPU moves the step to
step S25. On the other hand, when determining that the
second heating and dehumidifying operation is not being
performed, the CPU moves the step to step S2S.

(Step S25)
In the case of determining that the second heating and

dehumidifying operation is being performed in the step S24,
the CPU determines whether or not the diflerence (Tc—TEO)
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between the temperature Tc detected by the cooled air
temperature sensor 46 and the target temperature TEO of the
air flowing downstream from the heat exchanger 14 is
greater than a predetermined value. When determining that
the diflerence is greater than the predetermined value, the
CPU moves the step to step S30. On the other hand, when
determining that the difl'erence is the predetermined value or
smaller, the CPU moves the step to the step S26.

(Step S26)
In the case of determining that the difference (Tc—TEO)

between the temperature Tc detected by the cooled air
temperature 46 and the target temperature TEO of the air
flowing downstream from the heat exchanger 14 is the
predetermined value or smaller in the step 25, the CPU
determines whether or not the diflerence (TCO —TH)
between the target temperature TCO of the air flowing
downstream from the radiator 15 and the estimated tem-
perature TH of the air flowing downstream from the radiator
15 is greater than a predetermined value, or, determines
whether or not the difl'erence (TEO—Tc) between the target
temperature TEO of the air flowing downstream from the
heat exchanger 14 and the temperature Tc detected by the
cooled air temperature sensor 46 is greater than a predeter-
mined value. When determining that the difl'erence is greater
than the predetermined value, the CPU moves the step to the
step S23. On the other hand, when determining that the
difl'erence is the predetermined value or smaller, the CPU
moves the step to the step S27.

(Step S27)
In the case of determining that the difference (Tc—TEO)

between the detected temperature Tc and the target tempera-
ture TEO is greater than the predetermined value in the S22;
in the case of determining that the diflerence (TEO—Tc)
between the target temperature TEO of the air flowing
downstream from the heat exchanger 14 and the temperature
Tc detected by the cooled air temperature 46 is the prede-
termined value or smaller in the step 26; or when determin-
ing that the difference (TCO —TH) between the target tem-
perature TCO of the radiator 15 and the estimated
temperature TH is greater than a predetermined value in step
S29 described later, the CPU performs the second heating
and dehumidifying operation in the step S27 and ends the
process for controlling operation switching.

(Step S2S)
In the case of determining that the second heating and

dehumidifying operation is not being performed in the step
S24, the CPU determines whether or not the cooling opera-
tion or the cooling and dehumidifying operation is being
performed in the step S2S. When determining that the
cooling operation or the cooling and dehumidifying opera-
tion is being performed, the CPU moves the step to the step
S29. On the other hand, when determining that the cooling
operation or the cooling and dehumidifying operation is not
being performed, the CPU ends the process for controlling
operation switching.

(Step S29)
In the case of determining that the cooling operation or the

cooling and dehumidifying operation is being performed in
the step S2S, the CPU determines whether or not the
difl'erence (TCO —TH) between the target temperature TCO
of the radiator 15 and the estimated temperature TH of the
air flowing downstream from the radiator 15 is greater than
a predetermined value in the step 29. When determining that
the diflerence is greater than the predetermined value, the
CPU moves the step to the step S27. On the other hand,
when determining that the difl'erence is the predetermined
value or smaller, the CPU moves the step to the step S30.
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(Step S30)
In the case of determining that the difl'erence (Tc—TEO)

between the detected temperature Tc and the target tempera-
ture TEO is greater than the predetermined value in the step
S25, or, in the case of determining that the difl'erence

(TCO —TH) between the target temperature TCO and the
estimated temperature TH is the predetermined temperature
or smaller in the step S29, the CPU performs the cooling
operation or the cooling and dehumidifying operation in the
step S30 and ends the process for controlling operation
switching.

Here, the predetermined value of the difl'erence between
the temperature Tc detected by the cooled air temperature
sensor 46 and the target temperature TEO of the heat
exchanger 14, and the predetermined value of the difl'erence
between the target temperature TCO of the radiator 15 and
the estimated temperature TH of the air downstream from
the radiator 15 are both set within the range of, for example,
2 to 3 degrees Celsius. In addition, with the present embodi-
ment, the predetermined value is calculated based on the
temperature Tc detected by the cooled air temperature sensor
46, which is the temperature of the air flowing downstream
from the heat exchanger 14. However, the predetermined
value may be calculated based on an actual measured value
of the surface temperature (between the fins) of the heat
exchanger 14. Moreover, with the present embodiment, the
predetermined value is calculated based on the estimated
temperature TH of the air flowing downstream from the
radiator 15. However, the predetermined value may be
calculated based on an actual measured value of the air
flowing downstream from the radiator 15.

In this way, with the vehicle air conditioning apparatus
according to the present embodiment, during the cooling
operation and the cooling and dehumidifying operation, the
refrigerant passes through the outdoor heat exchanger 22
and passes through the supercooling radiator 24 and then
absorbs the heat in the heat exchanger 14. Meanwhile,
during the heating operation, the refrigerant passes through
the outdoor heat exchanger 22 and then is sucked into the
compressor 21 without passing through the supercooling
radiator 24. Moreover, during the first heating and dehu-
midifying operation and the second heating and dehumidi-

fying operation, the refrigerant passes through the radiator
15 and passes through the supercooling radiator 24, and then
absorbs the heat in the heat exchanger 14.By this means, the
refrigerant becomes in a supercooling state in the supercool-
ing radiator 24 and then flows through the heat exchanger
14, and therefore it is possible to improve the efficiency of
the air conditioning operation. Meanwhile, the refrigerant
not supposed to flow through the heat exchanger 14 is
sucked into the compressor 21 without passing through the
supercooling radiator 24. Therefore, it is possible to reduce
pressure loss, and consequently improve the efliciency of the
air conditioning operation.

Moreover, the receiver tank 23 which can accumulate the
liquid refrigerant is provided upstream from the supercool-
ing radiator 24 in the refrigerant flow direction. By this
means, it is possible to accumulate surplus refrigerant in the
receiver tank 23 during the cooling operation, the cooling
and dehumidifying operation, the first heating and dehu-
midifying operation and the second heating and dehumidi-

fying operation, and therefore to adjust the amount of the
refrigerant circulating in the refrigerant circuit 20 to a proper
amount.

Moreover, the refrigerant flow passage 201 is provided,
which allows the refrigerant discharged from the compressor
21 to directly flow into the outdoor heat exchanger 22. By
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this means, it is possible to flow the refrigerant at a high
temperature into the outdoor heat exchanger 22, and there-
fore to shorten the defrosting time when a frost is formed on
the outdoor heat exchanger 22.

Furthermore, the refrigerant flows into the outdoor heat
exchanger 22 from one end of the refrigerant flow path
formed in the outdoor heat exchanger 22 and is discharged
from the other end. By this means, the circuit configuration
of the refrigerant circuit 20 becomes simple, and therefore it
is possible to reduce the manufacturing cost.

Furthermore, the outdoor heat exchanger unit U is real-
ized by integrally form the outdoor heat exchanger 22, the
receiver tank 23, the supercooling radiator 24, the first
control valve 26, the first solenoid valve 2Sa, the second
solenoid valve 2Sb, the third solenoid valve 2Sc, the first
check valve 29a and the second check valve 29b. By this
means, it is possible to install the outdoor heat exchanger
unit U as one component, and therefore to reduce the
number of steps for the installation.

Moreover, the first control valve 26 including the expan-
sion part having the function as an electronic solenoid valve
and the condensing pressure regulating part having the
function as a solenoid valve which are integrally formed is
provided in the refrigerant circuit 20, and the input side into
which the refrigerant flows and the output side from which
the refrigerant is discharged are formed as connection ports,
respectively. By this means, two components having the
difl'erent functions are installed as one component, and
therefore it is possible to reduce the number of steps for the
installation.

Furthermore, when the outlets 11c, 11d and 11e are set to
the bi-level mode, the second heating and dehumidifying
operation is started and stopped, based on the temperature T
detected by the intake air temperature sensor 45. By this
means, it is possible to efficiently perform the second
heating and dehumidifying operation under the condition
with a low air conditioning load, and therefore to reduce the
energy consumption.

Furthermore, during the cooling and dehumidifying
operation or the first heating and dehumidifying operation,
the operation is switched to the second heating and dehu-
midifying operation, based on the temperature Tc detected
by the cooled air temperature sensor 46. By this means, it is
possible to perform the second heating and dehumidifying
operation under the condition with a low air conditioning
load, and therefore to reduce the energy consumption.

Furthermore, the temperature of the air flowing down-
stream from the radiator 15 is regulated by controlling the
number of rotations of the compressor 21, and the tempera-
ture of the air supplied to the vehicle interior is controlled to
be the target air-blowing temperature TAO by regulating the
opening of the air mix damper 16. By this means, it is
possible to optimize the temperature of the air supplied to
the vehicle interior, and therefore to optimize the tempera-
ture-humidity environment of the vehicle interior.

FIGS. 13 and 14 show Embodiment 2 of the present
invention. Here, the same components are assigned the same
reference numerals as in the above-described embodiment.

As shown in FIG. 13, the refrigerant flow passage 20e is
connected to the refrigerant flow passage 20f, thereby to
form a refrigerant flow passage 20m in the refrigerant circuit
20 of the vehicle air conditioning apparatus. A fifth solenoid
valve 2Se is provided in the refrigerant flow passage 20m. In
addition, a sixth solenoid valve 2Sfis provided downstream
from the connection part of the refrigerant flow passage 20e
with the refrigerant flow passage 20m. Moreover, a fifth
check valve 29e is provided in the upstream side of the
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connection part of the refrigerant flow passage 20fwith the
refrigerant flow passage 20m.

In the vehicle air conditioning apparatus having the
above-described configuration, the opening and closing of
each of the first control valve 26, the second control valve
27, the first to sixth solenoid valves 2Sa, 2Sb, 2Sc, 2Sd, 2Se
and 2Sfis switched during the cooling operation, the cooling
and dehumidifying operation, the heating operation, the first
heating and dehumidifying operation, the second heating
and dehumidifying operation and the defrosting operation,
as shown in the table of FIG. 14.

During the first heating and dehumidifying operation and
the second heating and dehumidifying operation, the refrig-
erant having passed through the refrigerant flow passage 20d
flows into the receiver tank 23 and then, flows into the heat
exchanger 14 without flowing into the supercooling radiator
24.

In this way, with the vehicle air conditioning apparatus
according to the present embodiment, the refrigerant
becomes in a supercooling state in the supercooling radiator
24, and then flows through the heat exchanger 14 during the
cooling operation and the cooling and dehumidifying opera-
tion. Therefore, it is possible to improve the efficiency of the
air conditioning operation. Meanwhile, the refrigerant not
supposed to flow through the heat exchanger 14 is sucked
into the compressor 21 without passing through the super-
cooling radiator 24. Therefore, it is possible to reduce
pressure loss, and consequently improve the efliciency of the
air conditioning operation.

In addition, during the first heating and dehumidifying
operation and the second heating and dehumidifying opera-
tion, the refrigerant discharged from the radiator 15 flows
through the receiver tank 23 without flowing into the super-
cooling radiator 24, and then flows into the heat exchanger
14. By this means, it is possible to reduce the pressure loss
during the first heating and dehumidifying operation and the
second heating and dehumidifying operation. In addition, it
is possible to accumulate surplus refrigerant in the receiver
tank 23, and therefore to adjust the amount of the refrigerant
circulating in the refrigerant circuit 20 to a proper amount.

FIGS. 15 and 16 show Embodiment 3 of the present
invention. Here, the same components are assigned the same
reference numerals as in the above-described embodiment.

As shown in FIG. 15, the refrigerant flow passage 20m
and the third check valve 29c are provided in the refrigerant
circuit 20 of the vehicle air conditioning apparatus, like
Embodiment 2. A three-way solenoid valve 2Sg is provided
at the connection point between the refrigerant flow passage
20e and the refrigerant flow passage 20m.

In the vehicle air conditioning apparatus having the
above-described configuration, the opening and closing of
each of the first control valve 26, the second control valve
27, the first to forth solenoid valves 2Sa, 2Sb, 2Sc and 2Sd,
and the three-way solenoid valve 2Sg is switched during the
cooling operation, the cooling and dehumidifying operation,
the heating operation, the first heating and dehumidifying
operation, the second heating and dehumidifying operation
and the defrosting operation, as shown in the table of FIG.
16.

During the first heating and dehumidifying operation and
the second heating and dehumidifying operation, the refrig-
erant having passed through the refrigerant flow passage 20d
flows into the receiver tank 23 and then, flows into the heat
exchanger 14 without passing through the supercooling
radiator 24.

In this way, with the vehicle air conditioning apparatus
according to the present embodiment, the refrigerant
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becomes in a supercooling state in the supercooling radiator
24, and then flows through the heat exchanger 14 during the
cooling operation and the cooling and dehumidifying opera-
tion. Therefore, it is possible to improve the efficiency of the
air conditioning operation. Meanwhile, the refrigerant not
supposed to flow through the heat exchanger 14 is sucked
into the compressor 21 without passing through the super-
cooling radiator 24. Therefore, it is possible to reduce
pressure loss, and consequently improve the efficiency of the
air conditioning operation.

In addition, during the first heating and dehumidifying
operation and the second heating and dehumidifying opera-
tion, the refrigerant discharged from the radiator 15 flows
through the receiver tank 23 without flowing into the super-
cooling radiator 24, and then flows into the heat exchanger
14. By this means, it is possible to reduce the pressure loss
during the first heating and dehumidifying operation and the
second heating and dehumidifying operation. In addition, it
is possible to accumulate surplus refrigerant in the receiver
tank 23, and therefore to adjust the amount of the refrigerant
circulating in the refrigerant circuit 20 to a proper amount.

FIGS. 17 and 1S show Embodiment 4 of the present
invention. Here, the same components are assigned the same
reference numerals as in the above-described embodiment.

As shown in FIG. 17, this vehicle air conditioning appa-
ratus includes a refrigerant flow passage 20n that connects
the refrigerant flow passage 20b to the refrigerant flow
passage 20f upstream from the internal heat exchanger 25,
instead of the refrigerant flow passage 20j described in
Embodiment l. In the refrigerant flow passage 20n, the
second solenoid valve 2Sb, the receiver tank 23a and the
second check valve 29b are provided in the order from the
upstream side.

In the vehicle air conditioning apparatus having the
above-described configuration, the opening and closing of
each of the first control valve 26, the second control valve
27, the first to forth solenoid valves 2Sa, 2Sb, 2Sc and 2Sd
is switched during the cooling operation, the cooling and
dehumidifying operation, the heating operation, the first
heating and dehumidifying operation, the second heating
and dehumidifying operation and the de frosting operation as
shown in the table of FIG. 1S.

During the first heating and dehumidifying operation and
the second heating and dehumidifying operation, the refrig-
erant having passed through the refrigerant flow passage 20n
flows into the receiver tank 23 and then, flows into the heat
exchanger 14 without flowing into the supercooling radiator
24.

In this way, with the vehicle air conditioning apparatus
according to the present embodiment, the refrigerant
becomes in a supercooling state in the supercooling radiator
24, and then flows into the heat exchanger 14 during the
cooling operation and the cooling and dehumidifying opera-
tion. Therefore, it is possible to improve the efficiency of the
air conditioning operation. Meanwhile, the refrigerant not
supposed to flow through the heat exchanger 14 is sucked
into the compressor 21 without passing through the super-
cooling radiator 24. Therefore, it is possible to reduce
pressure loss, and consequently improve the efficiency of the
air conditioning operation.

In addition, during the first heating and dehumidifying
operation and the second heating and dehumidifying opera-
tion, the refrigerant discharged from the radiator 15 flows
through the receiver tank 23 without flowing into the super-
cooling radiator 24, and then flows into the heat exchanger
14. By this means, it is possible to reduce the pressure loss
during the first heating and dehumidifying operation and the
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second heating and dehumidifying operation. In addition, it
is possible to accumulate surplus refrigerant in the receiver
tank 23, and therefore to adjust the amount of the refrigerant
circulating in the refrigerant circuit 20 to a proper amount.

FIGS. 19 to 29 show Embodiment 5 of the present
invention. Here, the same components are assigned the same
reference numerals as in the above-described embodiment.

As shown in FIG. 19, a refrigerant circuit 60 is provided
in the vehicle air conditioning apparatus.

To be more specific, the input side of the radiator 15 into
which the refrigerant flows is connected to the output side of
the compressor 21 from which the refrigerant is discharged
to provide a refrigerant flow passage 60a. Meanwhile, the
input side of the first control valve 26 into which the
refrigerant flows is connected to the output side of the
radiator 15 from which the refrigerant is discharged to
provide a refrigerant flow passage 60b. A first connection
port of the outdoor heat exchanger 22 is connected to the
output side of the condensing pressure regulating part of the
first control valve 26 from which the refrigerant is dis-
charged to provide a refrigerant flow passage 60c. A second
connection port of the outdoor heat exchanger 22 is con-
nected to the output side of the expansion port of the first
control valve 26 from which the refrigerant is discharged to
provide a refrigerant flow passage 60d. The first check valve
29a is provided in the refrigerant flow passage 60d. The
input side of the receiver tank 23 into which the refrigerant
flows is connected to the third connection port of the outdoor
heat exchanger 22 to provide a refrigerant flow passage 60e.
In the refrigerant flow passage 60e, the first solenoid valve
2Sa and the second check valve 29b are provided in the
order from the outdoor heat exchanger 22 side. The input
side of the supercooling radiator 24 into which the refrig-
erant flows is connected to the output side of the receiver
tank 23 from which the refrigerant is discharged to provide
a refrigerant flow passage 60f. The input side of the internal
heat exchanger 25 into which the high-pressure refrigerant
flows is connected to the output side of the supercooling
radiator 24 from which the refrigerant is discharged to
provide a refrigerant flow passage 60g. The input side of the
heat exchanger 14 into which the refrigerant flows is con-
nected to the output side of the internal heat exchanger 25
form which the high-pressure refrigerant is discharged to
provide a refrigerant flow passage 60h. The expansion valve
30 is provided in the refrigerant flow passage 60h. The input
side of the internal heat exchanger 25 into which a low-
pressure refrigerant flows is connected to the output side of
the heat exchanger 14 from which the refrigerant is dis-
charged to provide a refrigerant flow passage 60i. The
second control valve 27 is provided in the refrigerant flow

passage 60i. The suction side of the compressor 21 into
which the refrigerant is sucked is connected to the output
side of the internal heat exchanger 25 from which the
low-pressure refrigerant is discharged to provide a refriger-
ant flow passage 60j. In the refrigerant flow passage 60j, the
fifth check valve 29e and the accumulator 31 are provided in
the order from the internal heat exchanger 25 side. Part of
the refrigerant flow passage 60e between the first check
valve 29a and the receiver tank 23 is connected to the
refrigerant flow passage 60b to provide a refrigerant flow
passage 60k In the refrigerant flow passage 60k; the second
solenoid valve 2Sb and the third check valve 29c are
provided in the order from the refrigerant flow passage 60b
side. In addition, in the refrigerant flow passage 60c, part of
the refrigerant flow passage 60j between the internal heat
exchanger 25 and the accumulator 31 to provide a refriger-
ant flow passage 60l. The third solenoid valve 2Sc is
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provided in the refrigerant flow passage 60l. The refrigerant
flow passage 60a is connected to the refrigerant flow pas-
sage 60d downstream from the first check valve 29a in the
refrigerant flow direction to provide a refrigerant flow
passage 60m. In the refrigerant flow passage 60m, the fourth
solenoid valve 2Sd and the fourth check valve 29d are
provided in the order from the refrigerant flow passage 60a
stde.

As shown in FIG. 20, the outdoor heat exchanger 22 is
integrally formed with the receiver tank 23, the supercooling
radiator 24, the first control valve 26, the first solenoid valve
2Sa, the second solenoid valve 2Sb, the third solenoid valve
2Sc, the first check valve 29a, the second check valve 29b,
the third check valve 29C and the fourth check valve 29d,
and therefore to realize the outdoor heat exchanger unit U.

The partition members 22d partition each header 22a of
the outdoor heat exchanger 22 such that the cross section of
the refrigerant path decreases from the connection port of
the refrigerant flow passage 60c to the connection port of the
refrigerant flow passage 60e. By this means, when the
outdoor heat exchanger 22 functions as a radiator, the
refrigerant entering from the refrigerant flow passage 60c
passes through the refrigerant flow path whose cross section
gradually decreases, so that it is possible to reliably con-
dense the refrigerant vapor. Meanwhile, when the outdoor
heat exchanger 22 functions as an evaporator, the refrigerant
entering from the refrigerant flow passage 60d passes
through the refrigerant flow path whose cross section gradu-
ally increases. This allows the refrigerant with a greater
volume due to the evaporation to smoothly flow through, so
that it is possible to reduce pressure loss.

The first control valve 26 includes the refrigerant flow
channel to the expansion part and the refrigerant flow
channel to the condensing pressure regulating part, which
are provided for one refrigerant inlet. A valve element is
provided in each refrigerant flow channel to control its
opening. As shown in FIG. 21A, the first control valve 26
includes the expansion part as an electronic expansion valve
26a, and the condensing pressure regulating part as a sole-
noid valve 26b. As seen from the graph showing each valve
opening in FIG. 21A, the first control valve 26 can control
the valve opening of the electronic expansion valve 26a
between the completely closed state and the fully open state.
In addition, the opening and closing of the electronic expan-
sion valve 26b can be switched by turning on and ofl'.

As another configuration of the first control valve 26, as
shown in FIG. 21B, the expansion part and the condensing
pressure regulating part may be a small diameter valve 26c
and a large diameter valve 26d, respectively. Each of them
has an optionally controllable opening. In this case, the
opening of each of the small diameter valve 26c and the
large diameter valve 26d is optionally controllable between
the completely closed state and the fully open state.

Moreover, as another configuration of the first control
valve 26, as shown in FIG. 21C, the first control valve 26
may include a small diameter valve 26e and a large diameter
valve 26feach having the opening that steeply increases near
the fully open. By this means, it is possible to increase the
amount of the flowing refrigerant during the defrosting
operation, and therefore to shorten the time required for the
defrosting operation. As shown in FIG. 22, the small diam-
eter valve 26a includes a valve body 26e1, a valve seat 26e2
that can move upward and downward with respect to the
valve body 26e1, and a needle-like valve element 26e3 that
can move upward and downward with respect to the valve
seat 26e2. As shown in FIG. 22A, the small diameter valve
26e closes the refrigerant flow channel to the valve body
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26e1. Meanwhile, as shown in FIG. 22B, the valve element
26e3 moves upward to open the refrigerant flow channel,
and therefore to allow the refrigerant to flow through.
Moreover, as shown in FIG. 22C, the valve element 26e3
moves upward to move the valve seat 26e2 upward, and
therefore to separate between the valve seat 26e2 and the
valve body 26e1. By this means, it is possible to increase an
amount of the refrigerant flowing through.

Furthermore, as shown in FIG. 23, another configuration
of the first control valve 26 is possible where the first check
valve 29a is integrally formed.

The vehicle air conditioning apparatus having the above-
described configuration performs cooling operation, cooling
and dehumidifying operation, heating operation, first heat-
ing and dehumidifying operation, second heating and dehu-
midifying operation, and defrosting operation. Now, each
operation will be explained.

During the cooling and dehumidifying operation, in the
refrigerant circuit 60, the refrigerant flow channel to the
expansion part is closed while the refrigerant flow channel
to the condensing pressure regulating part is opened in the
first control valve 26; the first solenoid valve 2Sa is opened;
the second, third and fourth solenoid valves 2Sb, 2Sc and
2Sd are closed; and compressor 21 is operated. By this
means, as shown in FIG. 24, the refrigerant discharged from
the compressor 21 flows through in this order: the refrigerant
flow passage 60a; the radiator 15; the refrigerant flow
passage 60b; the condensing pressure regulating part of the
first control valve 26; the refrigerant flow passage 60c; the
outdoor heat exchanger 22; refrigerant flow passage 60e; the
receiver tank 23; the refrigerant flow passage 60f; the
supercooling radiator 24; the high-pressure side of the
internal heat exchanger 25; the refrigerant flow passage 60h;
the heat exchanger 14; the refrigerant flow passage 60i; the
low-pressure side of the internal heat exchanger 25; and the
refrigerant flow passage 60j, and is sucked into the com-
pressor 21.

During the cooling operation and the cooling and dehu-

midifying operation, the refrigerant having passed through
the outdoor heat exchanger 22 flows into the supercooling
radiator 24 via the receiver tank 23. Therefore, the liquid
refrigerant flowing into the supercooling radiator 24 is
subjected to a heat exchange with the outdoor air and
becomes in a supercooling state.

During the heating operation, in the refrigerant circuit 60,
the refrigerant flow channel to the expansion part is opened
while the refrigerant flow channel to the condensing pres-
sure regulating part is closed in the first control valve 26; the
third solenoid valve 2Sc is opened; the first, second, and
fourth solenoid valves 2Sa, 2Sb and 2Sd are closed; and the
compressor 21 is operated. By this means, as shown in FIG.
25, the refrigerant discharged from the compressor 21 flows
through in this order: the refrigerant flow passage 60a; the
radiator 15; the refrigerant flow passage 60b; the expansion
part of the first control valve 26; the refrigerant flow passage
60d; the outdoor heat exchanger 22; and the refrigerant flow

passages 60c and 60l, and is sucked into the compressor 21.
During the first heating and dehumidifying operation, in

the refrigerant circuit 60, the refrigerant flow channel to the
expansion part is opened while the refrigerant flow channel
to the condensing pressure regulating part is closed in the
first control valve 26; the second and third solenoid valves
2Sb and 2Sc are opened; the first and fourth solenoid valves
2Sa and 2Sd are closed; and the compressor 21 is operated.
By this means, as shown in FIG. 26, the refrigerant dis-
charged from the compressor 21 flows through in this order:
the refrigerant flow passage 60a; the radiator 15; and the
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refrigerant flow passage 60b. Part of the refrigerant flowing
through the refrigerant flow passage 60b flows through in
this order: the expansion part of the first control valve 26; the
refrigerant flow passage 60d; the outdoor heat exchanger 22;
and the refrigerant flow passages 60c and 60l, and is sucked
into the compressor 21. Meanwhile, the remaining refriger-
ant flowing through the refrigerant flow passage 60b flows
through in this order: the refrigerant flow passages 60k. and

60c; the receiver tank 23; the refrigerant flow passage 60f;
the supercooling radiator 24, the refrigerant flow passage
60g; the high-pressure side of the internal heat exchanger
25; the refrigerant flow passage 60h; the heat exchanger 14;
the refrigerant flow passage 60i; the low-pressure side of the
internal heat exchanger 25; and the refrigerant flow passage
60i, and is sucked into the compressor 21.

During the second heating and dehumidifying operation,
in the refrigerant circuit 60, both the refrigerant flow channel
to the expansion part and the refrigerant flow channel to the
condensing pressure regulating part are closed in the first
control valve 26; the second solenoid valve 2Sb is opened;
the first, third and fourth solenoid valves 2Sa, 2Sc and 2Sd
are closed; and the compressor 21 is operated. By this
means, as shown in FIG. 27, the refrigerant discharged from
the compressor 21 flows through in this order: the refrigerant
flow passage 60a; the radiator 15; the refrigerant flow

passages 60b, 60k. and 60e; the receiver tank 23; the refrig-
erant flow passage 60f; the supercooling radiator 24; the
refrigerant flow passage 60g; the high-pressure side of the
internal heat exchanger 25; the refrigerant flow passage 60h;
the heat exchanger 14; the refrigerant flow passage 60i; the
low-pressure side of the internal heat exchanger 25; and the
refrigerant flow passages 60j, and is sucked into the com-
pressor 21.

During the defrosting operation, in the refrigerant circuit
60, the refrigerant flow channel to the expansion part is
opened while the refrigerant flow channel to the condensing
pressure regulating part is closed in the first control valve 26;
the third and fourth solenoid valves 2Sc and 2Sd are opened;
and the first and second solenoid valves 2Sa and 2Sb are
closed, and the compressor 21 is operated. By this means, as
shown in FIG. 2S, part of the refrigerant discharged from the
compressor 21 flows through in this order: the refrigerant
flow passage 60a; the radiator 15; the refrigerant flow

passage 60b; the expansion part of the first control valve 26;
and the refrigerant flow passage 30d, and is sucked into the
compressor 21. Meanwhile, the remaining refrigerant dis-
charged from the compressor 21 flows through the refrig-
erant flow passages 60m and 60d, and flows into the outdoor
heat exchanger 22. The refrigerant discharged from the
outdoor heat exchanger 22 flows through the refrigerant flow

passages 60c and 60j, and is sucked into the compressor 21.
In the above-described air conditioning operations, the

opening and closing of each of the first control valve 26, the
second control valve 27, and the first to fourth solenoid
valves 2Sa, 2Sb, 2Sc and 2Sd is switched as shown in the
table of FIG. 29.

As described above, with the vehicle air conditioning
apparatus according to the present embodiment, the refrig-
erant becomes in a supercooling state in the supercooling
radiator 24, and then flows into the heat exchanger 14 during
the cooling operation and the cooling and dehumidifying
operation. Therefore, it is possible to improve the efficiency
of the air conditioning operation. Meanwhile, the refrigerant
not supposed to flow through the heat exchanger 14 is
sucked into the compressor 21 without passing through the

6

10

16

20

26

30

36

40

46

60

66

60

66

supercooling radiator 24. Therefore, it is possible to reduce
pressure loss, and consequently improve the efliciency of the
air conditioning operation.

In addition, the refrigerant flow path is formed in the
outdoor heat exchanger 22. For heat release, the refrigerant
flows into the first end of the refrigerant flow path, releases
the heat, and is discharged from the second end. Meanwhile,
for heat absorption, the refrigerant flows into the second end
of the refrigerant flow path, absorbs the heat, and is dis-

charged from the first end. By this means, in both the case
of condensing the refrigerant and the case of evaporating the
refrigerant in the outdoor heat exchanger 22, it is possible to
realize the refrigerant flow path that allows the refrigerant to
flow through in an optimal condition. Therefore, it is pos-
sible to improve the refrigerant condensing performance of
the outdoor heat exchanger 22. Moreover, it is possible to
reduce the pressure loss in evaporating the refrigerant in the
outdoor heat exchanger 22.

FIGS. 30 and 31 show Embodiment 6 of the present
invention. Here, the same components are assigned the same
reference numerals as in the above-described embodiment.

As shown in FIG. 30, the vehicle air conditioning appa-
ratus includes a refrigerant flow passage 60n configured to
connect the refrigerant flow passage 60b to the refrigerant
flow passage 60g upstream from the internal heat exchanger
25, instead of the refrigerant flow passage 60k. described in
Embodiment 5. In the refrigerant flow passage 60n, the
second solenoid valve 2Sb, the receiver tank 23a and the
second check valve 29b are provided in the order from the
upstream side.

In the vehicle air conditioning apparatus having the
above-described configuration, the opening and closing of
each of the first control valve 26, the second control valve
27, the first to forth solenoid valves 2Sa, 2Sb, 2Sc and 2Sd
is switched during the cooling operation, the cooling and
dehumidifying operation, the heating operation, the first
heating and dehumidifying operation, the second heating
and dehumidifying operation and the defrosting operation,
as shown in the table of FIG. 31.

During the first heating and dehumidifying operation and
the second heating and dehumidifying operation, the refrig-
erant having passed through the refrigerant flow passage 60n
flows into the receiver tank 23 and then, flows into the heat
exchanger 14 without passing through the supercooling
radiator 24.

As described above, with the vehicle air conditioning
apparatus according to the present embodiment, the refrig-
erant becomes in a supercooling state in the supercooling
radiator 24, and then flows into the heat exchanger 14 during
the cooling operation and the cooling and dehumidifying
operation. Therefore, it is possible to improve the efficiency
of the air conditioning operation. Meanwhile, the refrigerant
not supposed to flow through the heat exchanger 14 is
sucked into the compressor 21 without passing through the
supercooling radiator 24. Therefore, it is possible to reduce
pressure loss, and consequently improve the efliciency of the
air conditioning operation.

In addition, during the first heating and dehumidifying
operation and the second heating and dehumidifying opera-
tion, the refrigerant discharged from the radiator 15 flows
through the receiver tank 23 and then flows into the heat
exchanger 14 without passing through the supercooling
radiator 24. By this means, it is possible to reduce the
pressure loss also during the first heating and dehumidifying
operation and the second heating and dehumidifying opera-
tion. Moreover, it is possible to accumulate the surplus
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REFERENCE SIGNS LIST
26

10 air conditioning unit
11 air flow passage
14 heat exchanger
15 radiator
20 refrigerant circuit
21 compressor
22 outdoor heat exchanger
23, 23a receiver tank
24 supercooling radiator
26 first control valve
27 second control valve
2Sa, 2Sb, 2Sc, 2Sd first to fourth solenoid valve
29a, 29b, 29c, 29d, 29e first to fifth check valve
30 expansion valve
40 controller 40
60 refrigerant circuit

The invention claimed is:
1.A vehicle air conditioning apparatus comprising:
a compressor configured to compress and discharge a

refrigerant; 46

a radiator configured to release heat from the refrigerant;
a heat exchanger configured to absorb the heat into the

refrigerant;
an outdoor heat exchanger configured to release the heat

from or absorb the heat into the refrigerant; 60

an outdoor radiator configured to further release the heat
from the refrigerant having released the heat in the
outdoor heat exchanger;

a first operable mode comprising a cooling and/or cooling
and dehumidifying refrigerant circuit configured to 66

allow the refrigerant discharged from the compressor to
flow into the radiator, to allow the refrigerant having
passed through the radiator to flow into the outdoor
heat exchanger, to allow the refrigerant having passed
through the outdoor heat exchanger to flow into the 6o

outdoor radiator, to allow the refrigerant having passed
through the outdoor radiator to flow into the heat
exchanger via an expansion valve and to allow the
refrigerant having passed through the heat exchanger to
be sucked into the compressor; 66

a second operable mode comprising a heating refrigerant
circuit configured to allow the refrigerant discharged

36

refrigerant in a receiver tank 23a, and therefore to adjust the
amount of the refrigerant circulating in the refrigerant circuit
20 to a proper amount.

Here, with the above-described embodiments, a configu-
ration has been explained where the internal heat exchanger 6

is provided in the refrigerant circuit 20 or 60, it is by no
means limiting. It is possible to produce the same efl'ect in
the embodiment without the internal heat exchanger 25.

In addition, with the embodiments, the configuration of
the first control valve 26 has been described where the to
expansion part having a function as an electronic expansion
valve and the condensing pressure regulating part having a
function as a solenoid valve are integrally formed. However,
it is by no means limiting. Another configuration is possible
where, for example, the first control valve 26 includes a t6
three-way valve that can switch the refrigerant outlet from
one to the other and an expansion valve provided in one
refrigerant outlet.

Moreover, although with the embodiments, the expansion
valve 30 has been described as a temperature expansion 20

valve, it is by no means limiting, and an electronic expansion
valve is applicable.

from the compressor to flow into the radiator, to allow
the refrigerant having passed through the radiator to
flow into the outdoor heat exchanger via an expansion
part, and to allow the refrigerant having passed through
the outdoor heat exchanger to be sucked into the
compressor;

a third operable mode comprising a first heating and
dehumidifying refrigerant circuit configured to allow
the refrigerant discharged from the compressor to flow
into the radiator, to allow part of the refrigerant having
passed through the radiator to flow into the outdoor
heat exchanger via the expansion part, to allow remain-
ing refrigerant having passed through the radiator to
flow into the outdoor radiator, to allow the refrigerant
having passed through the outdoor radiator to flow into
the heat exchanger via the expansion valve, and to
allow the refrigerant having passed through the outdoor
heat exchanger and the refrigerant having passed
though the heat exchanger to be sucked into the com-
pressor;

a fourth operable mode comprising a second heating and
dehumidifying refrigerant circuit configured to allow
the refrigerant discharged from the compressor to flow
into the radiator, to allow the refrigerant having passed
through the radiator to flow into the outdoor radiator, to
allow the refrigerant having passed through the outdoor
radiator to flow into the heat exchanger via the expan-
sion valve, and to allow the refrigerant having passed
through the heat exchanger to be sucked into the
compressor;

an air flow passage configured to allow air to be supplied
to a vehicle interior to pass through, the heat exchanger
being disposed in an upstream side of an air flow
direction of the air flow passage, and the radiator being
disposed downstream from the heat exchanger;

an outlet switching part configured to switch modes
among: a vent mode to blow the air flowing through the
air flow passage toward a head of a passenger in the
vehicle interior, a foot mode to blow the air toward feet
of the passenger in the vehicle interior, and a bi-level
mode to blow the air toward the head and the feet of the
passenger in the vehicle interior, based on a target
air-blowing temperature of the air to be supplied to the
vehicle interior in order to set the temperature of the
vehicle interior to a target preset temperature;

an intake air temperature detector configured to detect a
temperature of the air flowing into the air flow passage;
and

a heating and dehumidifying controller configured to start
or stop an operation for the second heating and dehu-

midifying refrigerant circuit, based on the temperature
detected by the intake air temperature detector, when
the outlet switching part sets the bi-level mode.

2. The vehicle air conditioning apparatus according to
claim 1, further comprising a receiver tank configured to
accumulate a liquid refrigerant, the receiver tank being
provided upstream from the outdoor radiator in a refrigerant
flow direction.

3. The vehicle air conditioning apparatus according to
claim 1, further comprising:

a receiver tank configured to accumulate a liquid refrig-
erant; and

the first heating and dehumidifying refrigerant circuit
configured to allow the refrigerant discharged from the
compressor to flow into the radiator, to allow part of the
refrigerant having passed through the radiator to flow
into the outdoor heat exchanger via the expansion part,
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to allow remaining refrigerant having passed through
the radiator to flow into the receiver tank without

flowing into the outdoor radiator, to allow the refrig-
erant having passed through the receiver tank to flow
into the heat exchanger via the expansion valve, and to
allow the refrigerant having passed through the outdoor
heat exchanger and the refrigerant having passed
through the heat exchanger to be sucked into the
compressor.

4. The vehicle air conditioning apparatus according to
claim 3, further comprising:

the second heating and dehumidifying refrigerant circuit
configured to allow the refrigerant discharged from the
compressor to flow into the radiator, to allow the
refrigerant having passed through the radiator to flow
into the receiver tank without flowing into the outdoor
radiator, to allow the refrigerant having passed through
the receiver tank to flow into the heat exchanger via the
expansion valve, and to allow the refrigerant having
passed through the heat exchanger to be sucked into the
compressor.

5. The vehicle air conditioning apparatus according to
claim 1, further comprising:

an air temperature detector configured to detect the tem-
perature of the air flowing through the air flow passage;
and

an operation switching part configured to switch an opera-
tion for the first heating and dehumidifying refrigerant
circuit or the cooling and/or cooling and dehumidifying
refrigerant circuit to the operation for the second heat-

ing and dehumidifying refrigerant circuit, based on the
temperature detected by the air temperature detector.

6. The vehicle air conditioning apparatus according to
claim 1, further comprising:

a heated air temperature estimator configured to estimate
the temperature of the air flowing downstream from the
radiator in the air flow passage;

a compressor controller configured to control a number of
rotations of the compressor based on the temperature
estimated by the heated air temperature estimator;

an air mix damper configured to change a percentage of
the air flowing through the air flow passage that is
subjected to a heat exchange with the refrigerant flow-

ing through the radiator, wherein the percentage of the
air increases when an opening of the air mix damper is
greater; and

a damper opening controller configured to control the
opening of the air mix damper such that the tempera-
ture of the air supplied to the vehicle interior is the
target air-blowing temperature.

7. The vehicle air conditioning apparatus according to
claim 4, further comprising:

an air flow passage configured to allow air to be supplied
to a vehicle interior to pass through, the heat exchanger
being disposed in an upstream side of an air flow
direction of the air flow passage, and the radiator being
disposed downstream from the heat exchanger;
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a heat exchanger temperature detector configured to
detect a surface temperature of the heat exchanger or
the temperature of the air flowing downstream from the
heat exchanger in the air flow passage;

a radiator temperature detector configured to detect or
estimate the temperature of the air flowing downstream
from the radiator in the air flow passage; and

an operable mode switching controller configured to
switch the operable mode among the operable mode for
the cooling and/or cooling and dehumidifying refrig-
erant circuit, the operable mode for the first heating and
dehumidifying refrigerant circuit and the operable
mode for the second heating and dehumidifying refrig-
erant circuit, based on the temperature detected by a
cooled air temperature detector or a temperature esti-
mated by a heated air temperature estimator.

S. The vehicle air conditioning apparatus according to
claim 7, further comprising:

a defrosting circuit configured to allow at least part of the
refrigerant discharged from the compressor directly
into the outdoor heat exchanger.

9. The vehicle air conditioning apparatus according to
claim 7, further comprising an outdoor heat exchanger unit
including the outdoor heat exchanger, the outdoor radiator,
the receiver tank, a refrigerant flow passage that connects
between the outdoor heat exchanger and the receiver tank;
and a valve provided in the refrigerant flow passage, which
are integrally formed.

10. The vehicle air conditioning apparatus according to
claim 1, further comprising a control valve unit, the control
valve unit including:

the expansion part configured to decompress the refrig-
erant flowing into the outdoor heat exchanger when the
refrigerant absorbs heat in the outdoor heat exchanger;
and

a flow regulating part configured to regulate an amount of
the refrigerant flowing into the outdoor heat exchanger
when the refrigerant releases heat in the outdoor heat
exchanger, wherein the expansion part and the flow
regulating part are integrally formed,

wherein each of the expansion part and the flow regulat-
ing part has a refrigerant inlet and an refrigerant outlet,
and

the control valve unit includes a piping connection port
configured to allow communication with at least the
refrigerant inlet of each of the expansion part and the
flow regulating part.

11. The vehicle air conditioning apparatus according to
claim 10, wherein the control valve unit includes

a three-way valve that can switch a refrigerant outlet of
the control valve unit between the expansion part and
the flow regulating part; and

the expansion valve provided in the refrigerant outlet of
the expansion part.

12. The vehicle air conditioning apparatus according to
claim 10, wherein the expansion part is an electronic expan-
sion valve and the flow regulating part is a solenoid valve.
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